Company Number: 03272296

THE COMPANIES ACTS 1985 TO 1989

PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES

W RESOLTHORS : ”” l“ l”l I l l‘ l m l "mll mm
g
of 2 *AIBNDRTN*
7] A27 04/08/2007 751

COMPANIES HOUSE

CAIRNMUIR LIMITED

(Passedonthe Z\ dayof Auwy 2007

We, the undersigned, being all the members of the Company who at the date hereof would be
entitled to attend and vote at a general meeting of the Company, HEREBY PASS the
following Wnitten Resolutions pursuant to Section 381A of the Companies Act 1985 and
confirm that the said Written Resolutions shall, for all purposes, be as vahd and effective as if

the same had been passed by us at a general meeting of the Company duly convened and
held

WRITTEN RESOLUTIONS

I THAT new Articles of Association of the Company 1n the form attached to these

Written Resolutions be adopted as the Articles of Association of the Company to the

- exclusion of and i substitution for the existing Articles of Association of the
Company

2 THAT the 1,000 issued Institutional Ordinary Shares of 10p each 1n the capttal of the
Company held by Kitsons Group Limited be re-designated as Ordinary Shares of 10p
each

3 THAT the 300,000 1ssued Preference Shares of £1 each in the capital of the Company
held by Kitsons Group Limited be re-designated as Ordmary Shares of 10p each

Signature of these resolutions by any holders of any class of shares 1n the Company shall also
constitute their consent as holders of that class of shares to the passing of the resolutions set
out above and to any variations to or abrogation of the nghts of that class of shares resulung
from the resglutions set out above.

U

Signed for and on behalf of
Kitsons Group Limited as holder of Ordinary Shares

¢ \documents and setungsitf1Mocal setngstemporary internet files\olh42\ 146453021 _ukmatters(written sesolution carnmuir Limited -
adopt articles) doc



------

Kitsons Group Limited as holder of Institutional Ordinary Shares

it

Signed for and on behalf of
Kitsons Group Limited as holder of Preference Shares

¢ \documents and settingsitf01Yocal settmgsitemporary intemet ﬂlcﬁolkfﬂ\ 14645302_1_ukmatters{written resolution caimmuir limted -
adopt articles) doc




DLA PIPER

Company No 3272296

THE COMPANIES ACTS 1985 AND 1989

PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES
p—

*AIBNERTO* ~ =
ﬁ A7 04/08/2007 750
COMPANIES HOUSE
NEW
ARTICLES OF ASSOCIATION

OF CAIRNMUIR LIMITED

(Adopted by special resolution passed on 8 L.\U llj 2007)




Company No 3272296

THE COMPANIES ACTS 1985 and 1989
PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES
NEW
ARTICLES OF ASSOCIATION
of
CAIRNMUIR LIMITED

(Adopted by special resolution passed on "{ Ij\ﬂg 2007)

PRELIMINARY

1 The regulations contained 1n Table A n the schedule to the Compames (Tables A to F)
Regulations 1985 (as amended by the Companies (Tables A-F) (Amendment} Regulations
1985 and the Companies Act 1985 (Electronic Communications) Order 2000) ("Table A™)
shall apply to the Company unless or to the extent that they are excluded or modified by, or
are inconsistent with the following provisions and, with the provisions set out in this
document, shall consuitute the articles of association of the Company and, for the avoidance of

doubt, references in this document to "these articles” shall be construed accordingly

2 References in these articles to numbered regulations shall, unless the context requires
otherwise, be deemed to be references to regulations 1n Table A Regulations 24, 38, 59, 60,
61, 62, 64, 67, 73 to 81 nclusive, 90, 94, 95, 111, 112, 115 and 118 shall not apply
References in these articles to numbered articles shall be deemed to be references to

numbered provisions 1n this document
3 In these articles

"address" n relation to electronic communication means any number or address used for the

purposes of such communications,

"Parent Company'' means a corporate body which 1s the registered holder of not less than

all of the 1ssued shares i the Company,

"written'' and "in writing” include any method of representing or reproducing words 1n

legible form including, for the avoidance of doubt, electronic communication

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1 |




4 Where an ordinary resolution of the Company 15 required for any purpose, a special or
extraordinary resolution shall also be effective and where an extraordinary resolution 1s

required for any purpose, a special resolution shall also be effective
ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATION

5 Regulation 1 shall by modified by deleting the words ""electronic communication” means the
same as in the Electromc Communications Act 2000" and substituting instead the words

electronic communication” means any communication transmitted by way of fax or email”

and all references to "electromic communication” n these articles will be construed

accordingly
SHARE CERTIFICATES
6 Regulation 6 of Table A shall be modified by adding after "Every cert:ficate shall be sealed

with the seal” the words "or executed 1n such other manner as the directors authorise, having

regard to the Act”

REGISTRATION OF SHARES
7 Notwithstanding anything contained n these Articles
71 the directors (or director if there 1s only one) of the Company may not decline to

register any transfer of shares in the Company nor suspend registration of any such

shares, and

72 a holder of shares in the Company 1s not required to comply with any provision of the
Articles which restricts the transfer of shares or which requires any such shares to be
first offered to all or any current shareholders of the Company before any transfer

may take place,

where 1n any such case the transfer is or 1s to be

73 executed by a bank or institution to which such shares have been mortgaged or
charged by way of security (or by any nominee of such bank or institution) pursuant

to a power of sale under such secunty,

74 executed by a recerver or manager appointed by or on behalf of any such bank or

institution under any such security, or

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1 2




75 to any such bank or institution (or to 1ts nominee) pursuant to any such security, and

a certificate by any officer of such bank or institution that the shares were so charged and the

transfer was so executed shall be conclusive evidence of such facts
PURCHASE OF OWN SHARES

8 Regulation 35 shall be modified by deleting the words "otherwise than out of distributable
profits of the company or the proceeds of a fresh 1ssue of shares” and substituting instead the
words "whether out of its distributable profits or out of the proceeds of a fresh 1ssue of shares

or otherwise"
NOTICE OF GENERAL MEETINGS

9 Regulation 37 shall be modified by deleting the words "eight weeks" and substituting instead
the words "28 days"

10 An annual general meetung and an extraordinary general meeting catled for the passing of a
special resolution or an elective resolution shall be called by at least 21 clear days’ notice  All
other extraordinary general meetings shall be called by at least 14 clear days' notice but a

general meeting may be called by shorter notice 1f 1t 15 s0 agreed

101  1n the case of an annual general meeting, by ail the members entitled to attend and

vote at that meeting, and

102 in the case of any other meeting, by a majornity in number of the members having a
right to attend and vote, being a majority together holding not less than such
percentage n nomimal value of the shares giving that nght as has been determined by
elective resolution of the members n accordance with the Act, or 1If no such elective
resolution 1s 1n force, a majonty together holding not less than 95 per cent in nominal

value of the shares giving that right
PROCEEDINGS AT GENERAL MEETINGS

11 If and so long as there 1s a Parent Company, 1ts representative, appointed pursuant to article
14 of these articles or a proxy appointed by such a representative, shall be the only person
whose presence shall be required 1n order to constitute a quorum and regulation 40 shall be

modified accordingly

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 ] 3




12

13

14

A poll may be demanded by the chairman or by any member present 1n person or by proxy

and entitled to vote, and regulation 46 shall be modified accordingly

In the case of jomt holders of a share, the signature of any one of them 1s sufficient for the

purposes of passimg resolutions in wnting under regulation 53

A member of the Company which 1s a corporation may, by resolution of 1its directors or other
governing body, authonise such person as it thinks fit to act as us representative at any
meeting of the Company or at any meeting of any class of members of the Company The
person so authorised shall be entitled to exercise the same powers on behalf of the corporation
which he represents as that corporation could exercise 1f it were an individual member
Unless the directors otherwise decide, a copy of such authority certified notanally or in some
other way approved by the directors shall be delivered to the Company before such
representative 1s entitled to exercise any power on behalf of the corporation which he

represents

YOTES OF MEMBERS

15

16

Regulation 57 shall be modified by including after the word "shall” the phrase "unless the

directors otherwise decide”

On a show of hands or on a poll, votes may be given either perscnally or by proxy A
member may appoint more than one proxy to attend on the same occaston and deposit of an
instrument of proxy shall not preclude a member from attending and voting at the meeting or

at any adjourmnment of it

The appomntment of a proxy shall be m writing 1n any form which 1s usual or in any form

which the directors may approve, and shall be executed by or on behalf of the appointor

The appomntment of a proxy and any authority under which 1t 1s executed or a copy of such

authority certified notanally or 1n some other way approved by the directors may

181 1nthe case of an appointment of a proxy by a form of proxy (which for the avoidance
of doubt does not include an appointment contained n an electronic communication)
be received at the office or such other place within the United Kingdom as may be
specified 1n the notice convening the meeting and/or 1n any form of proxy or other
accompanyng document sent out by the Company 1n relation to the meeting not less
than one hour before the time for holding the meeting or adjourned meeting at which

the person named in the form of proxy proposes to vote, or

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




182

183

184

in the case of an appointment contained 1n an electronic commumcation, 1f an address

has been specified for that purpose
18 2 1 1n the notice convening the meeting, or

1822 m any form of proxy or other accompanying document sent out by the

Company n relation to the meeting, or

1823 m any invitation to appomt a proxy contained n an electronic commumcation

1ssued by the Company 1n relation to the meeting,

be received at such address not less than one hour before the time for holding the
meeting or adjourned meeting at which the person named in the appointment

proposes to vote, or

in the case of a poll taken more than 48 hours after it 1s demanded, be received as
aforesaid after the poll has been demanded but not less than one hour before the time

appointed for the taking of the poll, or

if a meeting 15 adjourned for less than 48 hours or if a poll 1s not taken immediately
but 1s taken not more than 48 hours after it was demanded, be delivered at the
adjourned meeting or at the meeting at which the poll was demanded to any director

or the secretary,

and an appomntment of a proxy which 1s not received or delivered in accordance with this

article 18 shall be invalid

NUMBER OF DIRECTORS

19

20

Unless otherwise determined by ordinary resolution, there shall not be any maximum number

of directors but the minimum number shall be one and, whilst there 15 only one director, he

shall constitute a quorum for all directors’ meetings and regulation 89 shall be modified

accordingly

When one diwrector only 1s in office, he shall have and may exercise all the powers and

authornities 1n and over the affairs of the Company as conferred on the board of directors by

these articles by written resolution

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1



APPOINTMENT AND RETIREMENT OF DIRECTORS

21 The directors shall (except 1n the case of the first directors) be apponted and shall (in every
case) be subject to removal from office by the Company 1n general meeting or 1f there 1s a
Parent Company, by tnstrument in writing executed by or on behalf of the Parent Company,
or if these 1s no Parent Company, by instrument in writing signed by or on behalf of the
holders of a majority of shares for the ime being 1ssued and entitling the holders thereof to
attend and vote at general meetings of the Company Every appointment or removal of a
director in wniting pursuant to this article shall take effect as from the time when the

instrument 1s delivered to the Company

22 The directors shall not be subject to retirement by rotatton Reference 1n any regulation to

retirement by rotation shall be disregarded
23 A director 1s not required to hold any qualification shares in the Company

24 A director shall not be required to vacate his office or be ineligible for re-election, and no
person shall be meligible for appointment as a director, by reason only of his attaimng or

having attained any particular age Section 293 of the Act shall not apply to the Company
ALTERNATE DIRECTORS

25 A director may appoint any person willing to act as such, whether or not he 1s a director of the
Company, to be an alternate director and such person need not be approved by resolution of

the directors, and regulation 65 shall be modified accordingly

26 An alternate director who 1s absent from the United Kingdom shall be entitled to receive
notice of all meetings of directors and meetings of commuttees of directors, and regulation 66

shall be modified accordingly

27 An alternate director ceases to be an alternate for tus appointor when his appointor ceases to

be a director
POWERS OF DIRECTORS

28 The directors may exercise all the powers of the Company to borrow money and to mortgage
or charge all or any part of its undertaking, property and uncalled capital and, subject to the
provisions of the Act, to 1ssue debentures, debenture stock and other securities either outright

or as security for any debt, liability or obligation of the Company or of any third party

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 | 6




DISQUALIFICATION AND REMOVAL OF DIRECTORS

29

The office of a director shall be vacated if

291  he ceases to be a director by virtue of any provision of the Act or becomes prohibited

by law from being a director,

292  he becomes bankrupt or makes any arrangement or composition with his creditors

generally,

293  he becomes, in the opinion of all his co-directors, incapable by reason of mental

disorder of discharging his duties as a director,
294  he resigns his office by notice 1n wnting to the Company,

295  both he and his alternate director (if any) are absent without the permission of the
directors from meetings of directors for six consecutive months, and the directors

resolve that his office be vacated, or

296 he 1s removed from office under article 21 of these articles

PROCEEDINGS OF DIRECTORS

30

31

Regulation 88 shall be modified by excluding the third sentence and substituting instead the
following sentence "Every director shall receive notice of a meeting whether or not he 1s

absent from the United Kingdom "

Any director or his alternate may validly participate in a meeting of the directors or a
committee of directors through the medium of conference telephone or similar form of
communication equipment provided that all persons participating i the meeting are able to
hear and speak to each other throughout such meeting A person so participating shall be
deemed to be present n person at the meeting and shall accordingly be counted in a quorum
and be entitled to vote Subject to the Act, all business transacted in such manner by the
directors or a commuttee of the directors shall, for the purposes of these articles, be deemed to
be vahdly and effectively transacted at a meeting of the directors or of a commuttee of the
directors even 1if fewer than two directors or alternate directors are physically present at the
same place Such a meeting shall be deemed to take place where the largest group of those
participating 15 assembled or, if there ts no such group, where the chairman of the meeting

then 15

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




DIRECTORS' APPOINTMENTS AND INTERESTS

32 Without prejudice to the obligation of a director to disclose his interest in contracts n
accordance with the Act, a director may vote at any meeting of the directors or of a commuttee
of directors on any resolutron concerning a matter 1n which he has, directly or indirectly, an
interest, and, if he does so vote, his vote shall be counted and he shall be counted n the

quorum present at a meeting 1n relation to any such resolution

33 A director may hold any other office or place of profit under the Company (other than the
office of auditor) mn conjunction with his office of director for such period and on such terms
(as to remuneration and otherwise) as the directors may determune, and no director or
intending director shall be disquahfied by his office from contracting with the Company
either with regard to his tenure of any such other office or place of profit or as vendor,
purchaser or otherwise, nor shall any such contract, or any contract or arrangement entered
into by or on behalf of the Company in which any director is 1n any way interested, be lhiable
to be avorded, nor shall any director so contracting or being so interested be lable to account
to the Company for any profit realised by any such contract or arrangement by reason of such

director holding that office or of the fiduciary relationship established by his holding of that

office
NOTICES
34 Any notice or other document to be served on or by or delivered to or by any person pursuant

to these articles (other than a notice calling a meeting of the directors) shall be 1n writing and
shall be served or delivered in accordance wath articles 35 and 36 or article 37 as the case may
be

35 Any notice or other document may only be served on, or delivered to, any member by the

Company
351 personally,

352 by sending 1t through the post 1n a prepaid envelope addressed to the member at his

registered address (whether such address be m the United Kingdom or otherwise),

353 by dehivery of 1t by hand to or leaving 1t at that address 1n an envelope addressed to

the member,

CD/MANDP/O3318/120005/14614135 1 3




354

except in the case of a share certificate and only if an address has been specified by

the member for such purpose, by electronic communication

36 In the case of joint holders of a share, all notices and other documents shall be given to the

person named first 1n the register 1n respect of the joint holding and notice so given shall be

sufficient notice to all joint holders

37 Any notice or other document may only be served on, or delivered to, the Company by

anyone

371

372

373

by sending 1t through the post 1n a prepaid envelope addressed to the Company or any
officer of the Company at the office or such other place in the United Kingdom as

may from time to time be specified by the Company,

by delivery of it by hand to the office or such other place in the United Kingdom as

may from time to time be specified by the Company,

if an address has been specified by the Company for such purpose (and in the case of
an appomntment of a proxy such address has been specified in a document or other

commumcation referred to 1n article 18 2), by electronic commumication

38 Any notice or other document (other than the appontment of a proxy)

381

382

383

addressed to the recipient in the manner prescribed by these articles shall, if sent by

post, be deemed to have been served or delivered
38 1 1 (if prepaid as first class) 24 hours after it was posted, and
3812 (if prepaid as second class) 48 hours after it was posted,

not sent by post but delivered by hand to or left at an address 1n accordance with
these articles shall be deemed to have been served or delivered on the day 1t was so

delivered or left,

sent by electronmic communication shall be deemed to have been served or delivered
48 hours after 1t was sent and 1n proving such service 1t shall be sufficient to produce
a transaction report or log generated by a fax machine which evidences the fax
transmission or a confirmation setting out the total number of recipients sent to or

each recipient to whorn the message was sent as the case may be

CD/MANDF/93318/120005/14614135 1




39

Regulation 116 shall be modified by deleting the words "within the United Kingdom”

INDEMNITY AND INSURANCE

40

41

Subject to the provisions of the Act but without prejudice to any indemnity to which he may
otherwise be entitled, every director, alternate director, auditor or other officer of the
Company shall be entitled to be indemmfied out of the assets of the Company against all
costs, charges, expenses, losses or habilities which he may sustamn or incur 1n or about the
execution of his office or otherwise n relation to it, including (without prejudice to the
generality of the foregoing) any liability incurred defending any proceedings, whether civil or
cniminal, which relate to anything done or omutted or alleged to have been done or omitted by
him as an officer or employee of the Company in which judgment 1s given in his favour or i
which he 1s acquitted, or which are otherwise disposed of without any finding or admussion of
matenal breach of duty on his part or in connection with any application in which relief 1s
granted to him by the court from liability for neghigence, default, breach of duty or breach of

trust in relation to the affairs of the Company

The directors may exercise all the powers of the Company to purchase and maintain for any
director, auditor or other officer (including former directors and other officers), or any person,
insurance agamnst any hability for negligence default, breach of duty or breach of trust or any

other liability 1n relation to the affairs of the Company which may be lawfully insured against

CD/MANDF/93318/120005/14614135 | 10




DLA PIPER

Company No 3272296

THE COMPANIES ACTS 1985 AND 1989

PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES

NEW
ARTICLES OF ASSOCIATION
OF CAIRNMUIR LIMITED

(Adopted by special resolution passed on 7 | :]"LALJ 2007)



Company No 3272296

THE COMPANIES ACTS 1985 and 1989

PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES

NEW
o
of E *AIBOBRTM*
7 A27 04/08/2007 M7
CAIRNMUIR LIMITED COMPANIES HOUSE

(Adopted by special resolution passed 0n$ NV lj 2007)

PRELIMINARY

1 The regulations contained 1n Table A in the schedule to the Compamies (Tables A to F)
Regulations 1985 (as amended by the Companmies (Tables A-F) (Amendment) Regulations
1985 and the Companies Act 1985 (Electromic Communications) Order 2000} (""Table A'")
shall apply to the Company unless or to the extent that they are excluded or modified by, or
are inconsistent with the following provisions and, with the provisions set out i this
document, shall constitute the articles of association of the Company and, for the avoidance of

doubt, references n this document to "these articles” shall be construed accordingly

2 References in these articles to numbered regulations shall, unless the context requires
otherwise, be deemed to be references to regulations in Table A Regulauons 24, 38, 59, 60,
61, 62, 64, 67, 73 to 81 nclusive, 90, 94, 95, 111, 112, 115 and 118 shall not apply
References 1n these articles to numbered articles shall be deemed to be references to

numbered provisions in this document
3 In these articles

"address'' in relation to electronic communication means any number or address used for the

purposes of such communications,

"Parent Company'' means a corporate body which is the registered holder of not less than

all of the 1ssued shares in the Company,

"written' and "in writing" include any method of representing or reproducing words 1n

legible form including, for the avoidance of doubt, electroric communication

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1 1




4 Where an ordinary resolution of the Company 1s required for any purpose, a special or
extraordinary resolution shall also be effective and where an extraordinary resolution 1s

required for any purpose, a special resolution shall also be effective
ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATION

5 Regulation 1 shall by modified by deleting the words ""electronic communication” means the
same as in the Electronic Communications Act 2000" and substituting instead the words
"“electronic communication” means any communication transmutted by way of fax or email”

and all references to "electromic communication” 1in these articles will be construed

accordingly
SHARE CERTIFICATES

6 Regulaton 6 of Table A shall be modified by adding after "Every ceruficate shall be sealed
with the seal” the words "or executed m such other manner as the directors authorise, having

regard to the Act"

REGISTRATION OF SHARES
7 Notwithstanding anything contained in these Articles
71 the directors (or director if there 1s only one) of the Company may not decline to

register any transfer of shares in the Company nor suspend registration of any such

shares, and

72 a holder of shares in the Company 1s not required to comply with any provision of the
Articles which restricts the transfer of shares or which requires any such shares to be
first offered to all or any current shareholders of the Company before any transfer

may take place,

where 1n any such case the transfer 1s or is to be

73 executed by a bank or mstiution to which such shares have been mortgaged or
charged by way of secunty (or by any nominee of such bank or institution) pursuant

to a power of sale under such securty,

74 executed by a receiver or manager appointed by or on behalf of any such bank or

institution under any such secunty, or

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 | 2




75 to any such bank or institution {or to its nominee) pursuant to any such security, and

a certificate by any officer of such bank or institution that the shares were so charged and the

transfer was so executed shall be conclusive evidence of such facts
PURCHASE OF OWN SHARES

8 Regulation 35 shall be modified by deleting the words "otherwise than out of distrnibutable
profits of the company or the proceeds of a fresh 1ssue of shares” and substituting 1nstead the
words "whether out of its distributable profits or out of the proceeds of a fresh 1ssue of shares

or otherwise"
NOTICE OF GENERAL MEETINGS

9 Regulation 37 shall be modified by deleting the words "eight weeks" and substituting instead
the words "28 days"

10 An annual general meeting and an extraordinary general meeting called for the passing of a
special resolution or an electtve resolution shall be called by at least 21 clear days' nouice All
other extraordinary general meetings shall be called by at least 14 clear days' notice but a

general meeting may be called by shorter notice 1f 1t 1s so agreed

101 in the case of an annual general meeting, by all the members entitled to attend and

volte at that meeting, and

102 1n the case of any other meeting, by a majority 1n number of the members having a
rnght to aitend and vote, being a majonty together holding not less than such
percentage in nominal value of the shares giving that right as has been determined by
elective resolution of the members 1n accordance with the Act, or if no such elective
resolution 1s 1n force, a majority together holding not less than 95 per cent in nominal

value of the shares giving that night
PROCEEDINGS AT GENERAL MEETINGS

11 If and so long as there 1s a Parent Company, its representative, appounted pursuant to article
14 of these articles or a proxy appointed by such a representative, shall be the only person
whose presence shall be required in order to constitute a quorum and regulation 40 shall be

modified accordingly

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 | 3




12

13

14

A poll may be demanded by the chairman or by any member present in person or by proxy

and entitled to vote, and regulation 46 shall be modified accordingly

In the case of joint holders of a share, the signature of any one of them 1s sufficient for the

purposes of passing resolutions in writing under regulation 33

A member of the Company which is a corporation may, by resolution of its directors or other
governing body, authorise such person as 1t thinks fit to act as its representative at any
meeting of the Company or at any meeting of any class of members of the Company. The
person so authorised shall be entitled to exercise the same powers on behalf of the corporation
which he represents as that corporation could exercise if it were an individual member
Unless the directors otherwise decide, a copy of such authonty certified notarially or 1n some
other way approved by the directors shall be delivered to the Company before such
representative 15 entitled to exercise any power on behalf of the corporation which he

represents

VOTES OF MEMBERS

15

17

18

Regulation 57 shall be modified by including after the word "shall" the phrase "unless the

directors otherwise decide”

On a show of hands or on a poll, votes may be given either personally or by proxy A
member may appoint more than one proxy to attend on the same occasion and deposit of an
instrument of proxy shall not preclude a member from attending and voting at the meeting or

at any adjournment of 1t

The appointment of a proxy shall be in writing 1n any form which 1s usual or in any form

which the directors may approve, and shall be executed by or on behalf of the appointor

The appomntment of a proxy and any authority under which 1t 1s executed or a copy of such

authority certified notarially or in some other way approved by the directors may

181  1n the case of an appointment of a proxy by a form of proxy (which for the avoidance
of doubt does not include an appointment contained in an electronic communication)
be recerved at the office or such other place within the United Kingdom as may be
specified 1n the notice convening the meeting and/or 1n any form of proxy or other
accompanying document sent out by the Company 1n relation to the meeting not less
than one hour before the time for holding the meeting or adjourned meeting at which

the person named 1n the form of proxy proposes to vote, or

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




182

183

184

in the case of an appointment contained 1n an electronic communication, if an address

has been specified for that purpose
18 2 1 1n the notice convening the meeting, or

1822 1n any form of proxy or other accompanying document sent out by the

Company n relation to the meeting, or

I8 23 1 any invitation to appoint a proxy contained 1n an electronic communication

1ssued by the Company in relation to the meeting,

be received at such address not less than one hour before the time for holding the
meeting or adjourned meeting at which the person named in the appointment

proposes to vote, or

in the case of a poll taken more than 48 hours after 1t 1s demanded, be received as
aforesaid after the poll has been demanded but not less than one hour before the time

appounted for the taking of the poll, or

if a meeting 18 adjourned for less than 48 hours or if a poll 1s not taken rmmediately
but 15 taken not more than 48 hours after 1t was demanded, be delivered at the
adjourned meeting or at the meeting at which the poll was demanded to any director

or the secretary,

and an appointment of a proxy which 1s not received or delivered in accordance with this

article 18 shall be mvalid

NUMBER OF DIRECTORS

19

20

Unless otherwise determined by ordinary resolution, there shall not be any maximum number

of directors but the mimimum number shall be one and, whulst there 1s only one director, he

shall constitute a quorum for all directors’ meetings and regulation 89 shall be modified

accordingly

When one director only 1s i office, he shall have and may exercise all the powers and

authorities in and over the affairs of the Company as conferred on the board of directors by

these articles by written resolution

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




APPOINTMENT AND RETIREMENT OF DIRECTORS

21.

22,

23

24

The directors shall (except in the case of the first directors) be appointed and shall (1n every
case) be subject to removal from office by the Company in general meeting or if there 1s a
Parent Company, by instrument 1n wnting executed by or on behalf of the Parent Company,
or if these 1s no Parent Company, by istrument in wnting signed by or on behalf of the
holders of a majority of shares for the time being 1ssued and entitling the holders thereof to
attend and vote at general meetings of the Company Every appointment or removal of a
director 1n writing pursuant to this artucle shall take effect as from the time when the

mstrument 15 delivered to the Company

The directors shall not be subject to reurement by rotaton Reference in any regulation to

retirement by rotation shall be disregarded
A director 15 not required to hold any qualification shares in the Company

A director shall not be required to vacate his office or be ineligible for re-election, and no
person shall be ineligible for appointment as a director, by reason only of his attaining or

having attamed any particular age Section 293 of the Act shall not apply to the Company

ALTERNATE DIRECTORS

25.

26

27

A director may appoint any person willing to act as such, whether or not he 15 a director of the
Company, to be an alternate director and such person need not be approved by resolution of

the directors, and regulation 65 shall be modified accordingly

An alternate director who 1s absent from the United Kingdom shall be entitled to receive
notice of all meetings of directors and meetings of commuttees of directors, and regulation 66

shall be modified accordingly

An alternate director ceases to be an alternate for his appointor when his appomntor ceases to

be a director

POWERS OF DIRECTORS

28

The directors may exercise all the powers of the Company to borrow money and to mortgage
or charge all or any part of its undertaking, property and uncalled capital and, subject to the
provisions of the Act, to 1ssue debentures, debenture stock and other secunties either outnght

or as secunity for any debt, liability or obligation of the Company or of any third party

CD/MANDF/93318/120005/14614135 1




DISQUALIFICATION AND REMOVAL OF DIRECTORS

29

The office of a director shall be vacated if

291  he ceases to be a director by virtue of any provision of the Act or becomes prohibited

by law from being a director,

292  he becomes bankrupt or makes any arrangement or composition with his creditors

generally,

293  he becomes, 1n the opimon of all his co-directors, incapable by reason of mental

disorder of discharging his duties as a director,
294  he resigns his office by notice in writing to the Company,

295  both he and his alternate director (if any) are absent without the permussion of the
directors from meetings of directors for six consecutive months, and the directors

resolve that his office be vacated, or

206 he 1s removed from office under article 21 of these articles

PROCEEDINGS OF DIRECTORS

30

31

Regulation 88 shall be modified by exciuding the third sentence and substituting instead the
following sentence "Every director shall receive notice of a meeting whether or not he 1s

absent from the United Kingdom "

Any director or lis alternate may valdly participate 1n a meeting of the directors or a
committee of directors through the medium of conference telephone or similar form of
communication equipment provided that all persons participating in the meeung are able to
hear and speak to each other throughout such meeting A person so participating shall be
deemed to be present in person at the meeting and shall accordingly be counted in a quorum
and be entitled to vote Subject to the Act, all business transacted in such manner by the
directors or a commuttee of the directors shall, for the purposes of these articles, be deemed 1o
be validly and effecuvely transacted at a meeting of the directors or of a committee of the
directors even 1if fewer than two directors or alternate directors are physically present at the
same place Such a meeting shall be deemed to take place where the largest group of those
participating 1s assembled or, if there 1s no such group, where the chairman of the meeting

then 1s

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




DIRECTORS' APPOINTMENTS AND INTERESTS

32

33

Without prejudice to the obligation of a director to disclose his interest in contracts 1n
accordance with the Act, a director may vote at any meeting of the directors or of a committee
of directors on any resolution concerning a matter 1n which he has, directly or indirectly, an
interest, and, 1f he does so vote, his vote shall be counted and he shall be counted in the

quorum present at a meeting n relation to any such resolution

A director may hold any other office or place of profit under the Company (other than the
office of auditor) in conjunction with his office of director for such perniod and on such terms
(as to remuneration and otherwise) as the directors may determine, and no director or
intending director shall be disqualified by his office from contracting with the Company
either with regard to his tenure of any such other office or place of profit or as vendor,
purchaser or otherwise, nor shall any such contract, or any contract or arrangement entered
into by or on behalf of the Company in which any director 1s 1n any way interested, be liable
to be avoided, nor shall any director so contracting or being so interested be lable to account
to the Company for any profit realised by any such contract or arrangement by reason of such
director holding that office or of the fiduciary relationship established by his holding of that

office

NOTICES

34

35

Any notice or other document to be served on or by or delivered to or by any person pursuant
to these articles (other than a notice calling a meeting of the directors) shall be in wniting and
shall be served or delivered in accordance with articles 35 and 36 or article 37 as the case may
be

Any notice or other document may only be served on, or delivered to, any member by the

Company
351  personally,

352 by sending 1t through the post 1n a prepaid envelope addressed to the member at s

registered address (whether such address be 1n the United Kingdom or otherwise),

353 by dehivery of it by hand to or leaving 1t at that address 1n an envelope addressed to

the member,

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 1




36

37

38

354  except m the case of a share certificate and only if an address has been specified by

the member for such purpose, by electronic communication

In the case of jont holders of a share, all notices and other documents shall be given to the
person named first 1n the register in respect of the joint holding and notice so given shall be

sufficient notice to all joint holders

Any notice or other document may only be served on, or delivered to, the Company by

anyone

371 by sending ut through the post 1n a prepaid envelope addressed to the Company or any
officer of the Company at the office or such other place in the Umted Kingdom as

may from time to time be specified by the Company,

372 by delivery of it by hand to the office or such other place in the United Kingdom as

may from time to time be specified by the Company,

373  if an address has been specified by the Company for such purpose (and 1n the case of
an appointment of a proxy such address has been specified 1n a document or other

communication referred to in article 18 2), by electronic communication
Any notice or other document (other than the appointment of a proxy)

381  addressed to the recipient in the manner prescribed by these articles shall, if sent by

post, be deemed to have been served or delivered
38 11 (if prepard as first class) 24 hours after 1t was posted, and
3812 (:f prepaid as second class) 48 hours after 1t was posted,

382  not sent by post but delivered by hand to or left at an address in accordance with
these articles shall be deemed to have been served or delivered on the day 1t was so

delivered or left,

383  sent by electronic communication shall be deemed to have been served or delivered
48 hours after 1t was sent and 1n proving such service 1t shall be sufficient to produce
a transaction report or log generated by a fax machine which evidences the fax
transmission or a confirmation setting out the total number of recipients sent to or

each recipient to whom the message was sent as the case may be

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/145614135 |




39

Regulation 116 shall be modified by deleting the words "within the United Kingdom"

INDEMNITY AND INSURANCE

40

41

Subject to the provisions of the Act but without prejudice to any indemnity to which he may
otherwise be entitled, every director, alternate director, auditor or other officer of the
Company shall be entitled to be indemnified out of the assets of the Company against all
costs, charges, expenses, losses or habilities which he may sustam or incur 1n or about the
execution of his office or otherwise n relation to it, including (without prejudice to the
generality of the foregoing) any hability incurred defending any proceedings, whether cival or
crimunal, which relate to anything done or omitted or alleged to have been done or omitted by
him as an officer or employee of the Company 1n which judgment 1s given 1n his favour or 1n
which he 1s acquitted, or which are otherwise disposed of without any finding or admission of
material breach of duty on his part or n connection with any application in which relef 1s
granted to him by the court from liability for negligence, default, breach of duty or breach of

trust 1n relation to the affairs of the Company

The directors may exercise all the powers of the Company to purchase and maintain for any
director, auditor or other officer (including former directors and other officers), or any person,
insurance against any liability for neghgence default, breach of duty or breach of trust or any

other hiabtlity in relation to the affairs of the Company which may be lawfully insured against

CD/MANDP/93318/120005/14614135 | 10




